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Aluminum Athletic Pyramid School
BID ITEM Mo Jo Sports Equipment MFAC, LLC Bumblebee Riddle MEDCO Surgical Supply BSN Sports Rogers Athletic Co Pro.
Hancock County High Football Equipment
17%” White Athletic
Coach Tape (J&J NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 58.00 58.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID
#4050)
Nike Pro Impact Girdles 5 gy NO BID NO BID NO BID 24.00 NO BID 39.99 NO BID NO BID
(with hip & tail pads
sewn in)
McDavid Integrated
Girdle (with hip & tail
pads sewn in) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.00 NO BID 31.99 NO BID NO BID
McDavid Integrated Old modle custom
Girdle (with hip & tail paint priced
i 367.00
pads sewn in) NO BID NO BID NO BID 225.00 NO BID separate F7 NO BID NO BID
Add 15.00 for XL $315.00
Vengence Pro
Riddell Football Helmet SPEED
(Revo & Speed) ICON
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
$257.00
Add 15.00 for XL
Red, 4-pt. high hook-up,
. RIDDELL R45621XX
hard-cup chin straps
NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.99 $12.95 NO BID 9.96 NO BID NO BID
Aluminum Athletic )
T Pyramid School
BID ITEM Mo Jo Sports MFAC, LLC Bumblebee Riddle MEDCO Surgical Supply BSN Sports Rogers Athletic Co Pro.
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Multi-panel Wrist coach RIDDELL APH 3
Ng‘;@““ NO BID NO BID 10.25 $9.27 NO BID 5.25 NO BID 4.39
10
Footballs (Spalding Alpha
Blend) 63.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 65.55 NO BID 59.00
11
Shoulder Pads — Schutt ALT/RIDDELL
- PHENOM R48325
Flat pad (Tornado Series) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 141.50 NO BID NO BID
$115.00
12
Shoulder Pads — Douglas ALT/RIDDELL R48334
i SPX
(DP & NP Series) NO BID NO BID NO BID 185.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
$230.00
13
ALT/RIDDELL R48312
Shoulder Pads — Gear KOMBINE SP
2000 Flat Pad (X-27/X- NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $145.00 NO BID 33.77 NO BID NO BID
SOB/X-56 series )
14
Pre-Wrap (Cramer #
92200
CR214592) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 45.32 o 6t NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 '
White Practice Pants ALT/RIDDELL RPPPC
(Rawlings & Russell) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.97 NO BID Rawlings 28.75 NO BID Russell
' Russell 12.50 $10.72
16
Practice Jerseys (Red w/ ALT/RIDDELL RP Rawlings 13.25
white print) (Rawlings &
JME Pro Down 12.25
. NO BID NO BID NO BID 23.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pro-Down $13.75 Rawlings 23.25
17 Pro Down 22.25
Mini Fox 40 Whistles w/ Set of 12 only
Lanyards NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.71 per set NO BID NO BID
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19 BID ITEM Mo Jo Sports BQUEMETE  aeae e Bumblebee Riddle MEDCO Surgical Supply ~ BSN Sports Rogers Athletic Co  Pro.
ATH. SPEC.STPO 79269
Stopwatch NO BID NO BID NO BID 29.99 $11.39 6.10 NO BID 8.00
10.12
20
RIDDELL R45791 50pkg full pk
, 265749 Pack of 25 PKg TUTL PE
Red Mouthpieces $0.36 EACH NO BID NO BID $0.45EA $0.35 NO BID only
0.43 $7.50
21 $0.38
stand Un Dummies/ 19 ROGERS 410090
an p bummies,
s, Rogers #410090 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $225.00 NO BID NO BID 215.00 NO BID
22
Varsity Lightweight/
Thigh & Knee Pad RIDDELL ALT
Seteschutt 71328190 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID RA816755.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
53| &#13041502
RIDDELL
ies — RV60
Half Round Dummies -8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 155.00 NO BID
height $62.00
24
Step-Over Agility Pads-
8” & 10” height ROGERS 4101 " only Pro D
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID OGERS 410103 NO BID 8" only Pro Down 145.00 NO BID
150.00 Step over 61.48
25
X-Large Equipment Bags RIDDELL R27574 10.88
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.00 NO BID NO BID 16.25
26
ility Traini CHAMPRO A820
Agility Training Ladder 081249408
NO BID NO BID NO BID 64.99 $27.45 9.58 105.00/ ea 21.00
57 $39.34
Low Profile Cones w/
wire carrier NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.96 NO BID 16.50
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29 BID ITEM Mo Jo Sports BQUEMETE  aeae e Bumblebee Riddle MEDCO Surgical Supply ~ BSN Sports Rogers Athletic Co  Pro.
Adult football knee pads RIDDELL R48168 .
1 carrier, 12 cones
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.75 NO BID . NO BID 3.60
2.78 pair
30
TACHIKARA TPE-33
Electric air compressor NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $107.12 NO BID 62.45 NO BID 53.00
31 |for footballs
Riddell and Schutt RIDDELL R27590
- helmet hardware NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $227.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Riddell and Schutt ear RIDDELL
pads for helmets NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.50 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
33
Riddell and Schutt RIDDELL R27645
helmet inflator with NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
34 | needles for each
Wheeled water
hydration system RIDDELL 43400
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID VPM-T-G2 $1800.00 $406.64 1050 1325.00/ea NO BID
35
Yellow practice pennies RIDDELL RSVN
and / or helmet covers PENNIES
$4.50
Helmet Covers
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 35.53 per dz 2.45
CHAMPRO $3.00 $72.00dz
A060 HELMET
COVERS
36
Mesh ball bags RIDDELL RRMEB35
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.50 NO BID 2.70 each NO BID 2.39
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38 BID ITEM Mo Jo Sports BQUEMETE  aeae e Bumblebee Riddle MEDCO Surgical Supply ~ BSN Sports Rogers Athletic Co  Pro.
Wilson 1003 GST 1014082
practice football NO BID NO BID NO BID 68.99 $80.73 NO BID 59.65 NO BID 65.00
39
Wilson NCAA 1003 GST
NO BID NO BID 76.99 NO BID NO BID 77.14 NO BID 71.00
40 $74.95
Riddell Integrated RIDDELL RGWPT
Girdles NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
41 24.00
42 |Hancock County Middle School Football
Helmet hardware
43| Foing kit $81.00 NO BID NO BID 95.00 196.00 NO BID 83.81 NO BID NO BID
269065 Pack of 10
Cones NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2.71 PER DZ ack o 3.69
44 $25.30 $49.00
Cramer Athletic Tape
081613942
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 58.00 51.27 NO BID NO BID
45 S42.74
Scarlet Mouthpiece 50/PKG FULL
0.36 EA BOX OF 265749
> 100 NO BID NO BID $0.45 EA 0.40 £0.43 Pack of 25 NO BID PKG ONLY
46 ' $7.50 $0.38
White/Hard cup/ Chin
Straps NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.99 12.00 NO BID 12.66 NO BID NO BID
47
4g |Re8ular Chin Strap NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.99 6.00 NO BID 5.50 NO BID NO BID
49 2" Orange Kicking Tee NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3.75 NO BID 1.49 NO BID 1.72
50 White Practice Pants NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.97 NO BID 12.50 NO BID 10.75
(football)
Schutt Shoulder Pads
(120-140) (130-150) (160- NO BID NO BID NO BID 185.00 71.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

51
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52 BID ITEM Mo Jo Sports BQUEMETE  aeae e Bumblebee Riddle MEDCO Surgical Supply ~ BSN Sports Rogers Athletic Co  Pro.
o3| RedBelts $0.60 EA NO BID NO BID 14.00 0.60 NO BID 0.52 NO BID 0.60
Youth TDY footballs —
4 |leather only $35.05 NO BID NO BID 46.99 NO BID NO BID 38.95 NO BID 37.95
Girdles —integrated pads  $19.95 C Adult $21.95
o il : ramet NO BID NO BID 24.99 24.00 NO BID ult > NO BID 21.95
55 (NP anatal Tornado Youth $11.50
Mesh Travel Bag with
numbers (That will fit NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
shoulder pads/helments)
56
57 |Pre-Wrap NO BID NO BID NO BID $48.00/case 48.00 92126 $36.76 45.61/CS NO BID NO BID
sg |Thigh Pad Sets NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.75 NO BID 6.16 NO BID 7.65
Red Practice Jersey’s
: NO BID NO BID NO BID 23.00 13.75 NO BID 12.25 NO BID NO BID
59 with number (football)
Silver football pants with
red stripe NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 31.00 NO BID 12.50 NO BID NO BID
60
Helmets Schutt Air RIDDELL ALT R41169
Advantage Old Model youth
g NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID SPEED CLASSIC YOUTH NO BID NO BID NO BID
A1l $110.00
61 $182.00
Rawlings Shoulder
om e NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 78.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
62
Ice packs
63 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.84 16/CS 16.20 NO BID NO BID
Knee Pads — Youth
(lightweight and small) NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.50 3.50 NO BID 2.78 PAIR NO BID NO BID
64
Nike Multi-Page Wrist
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.27 NO BID 14.78 NO BID 3.20

65
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66 BID ITEM Mo Jo Sports BQUEMETE  aeae e Bumblebee Riddle MEDCO Surgical Supply ~ BSN Sports Rogers Athletic Co  Pro.
o, | Q8 Rib Protector NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 40.00 NO BID 23.17 NO BID NO BID
B Shoulder Pads —
QB Shoulder Pads ~ (any NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 115.00 NO BID 23.17 NO BID 18.95
68 |brand)
69 |VOLLEYBALL EQUIPMENT
Mizuno LR6 Kneepads
(white only) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 19.02 NO BID 15.95
70
Big Red Volleyball
21| scorebooks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
L ball
75| Braden Practice Balls NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID e’;‘;';ﬁ_: > NO BID 28.00
Baden Perfection VXSEC--
210 Red White and Blue NO BID NO BID NO BID $51.95 NO BID NO BID 49.32 NO BID 43.00
73 |Game Balls
Baden Perfection
VXSEC-210 Pink Game NO BID NO BID NO BID $51.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
74| Ball
75 CROSS COUNTRY/ TRACK
Stainless Shot Put (4k)
- NO BID 99.00 88.00 79.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Stainless Shot Put (12lbs)
. NO BID 110.00 102.00 84.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Jg |5t ron shot Put (4k) NO BID 29.00 19.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.23 NO BID NO BID
Cast Iron Shot Put (12
79 |ibs) NO BID 39.00 23.50 34.99 NO BID NO BID 11.98 NO BID NO BID
Cast Iron Shot Put (16
NO BID 55.00 28.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

80

Ibs)




A B C | D E F G H | J
Alumlmfm Athletic Pyramid School
81 BID ITEM Mo Jo Sports BQUEMETE  aeae e Bumblebee Riddle MEDCO Surgical Supply ~ BSN Sports Rogers Athletic Co  Pro.
Cast Iron Shot Put
82 |(8lbs)Cast Iron Shot Put NO BID 28.00 19.00 24.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
83 |Cast Iron Shot Put (2k) NO BID NO BID 17.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Metal Rimmed Wood
. NO BID 40.00 31.00 59.99 NO BID NO BID 11.84 NO BID NO BID
84 |Discus (1.0k)
Metal Ri d Wood
el rimmed Too NO BID 45.00 32.00 64.99 NO BID NO BID 15.22 NO BID NO BID
85 |Discus (1.6K)
Fiberglass tape measure NO BID NO BID 15.00 22.99 NO BID NO BID 4,94 NO BID 6.25
86 |60 ft or longer
Fiberglass tape measure NO BID 19.00 19.00 32.99 NO BID NO BID 7.09 NO BID 8.69
87 | 165 ft. or longer
Aerosol Field Paint 20 oz.
per dozen (Red) NO BID NO BID NO BID 57.00 NO BID NO BID 49.83 NO BID 50.00
88
Aerosol Field paint 20 oz
per dozen (White) NO BID NO BID NO BID 53.95 NO BID NO BID 49.83 NO BID 50.00
89
.32 caliber starting pistol 85.00
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
90 BOX OF 50
.32 caliber blanks per BOX OF 50
100 NO BID NO BID 50.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
91 65.00
.22 caliber blanks per
92 1100 NO BID NO BID 18.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Stick rollers (various 18"- 2395
styles and sizes) NO BID NO BID wa NO BID NO BID NO BID 23.44 NO BID NO BID
93 24" 34.50
Foam RoIIer's (various 2201-01 $11.00
styles and sizes) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 21.98 NO BID NO BID

94

220103 $19.95
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95 BID ITEM Mo Jo Sports BQUEMETE  aeae e Bumblebee Riddle MEDCO Surgical Supply ~ BSN Sports Rogers Athletic Co  Pro.
Stopwatch printer rolls SEIKO0 5950/1
(thermal Paper) NO BID EZAEEO 11.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 11.95
9% '
Exchange Zone/Official AAE-OF-RW
o7 |Flags (red/white) NO BID $25.00 12.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hurdles ( Adjustable to T GAAFURY
30” 33" 36” 39” and Hurdle Pricing-
42,,') ! ! hurdles must be ASB3500X ELITE
ordered @ the $87.72
same time &
AAE-HSAH shipped to same
NO BID $88.00 location. $69.99-124.99 134.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1-10- S$114.00
11-20-5110.00
21-30-5107.00
31-40 - $106.00
98 v | 41-50 — $104.00
(adjustable angles on AAE TSB-PRO
ec:als) & NO BID $105.00 $85.00 NO BID 120.35 NO BID 60.55 NO BID 74.00
9| P
High Jump Mat
100 NO BID P G BB NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
High Jump Bar #5934-01
NO BID $179.00 74.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID 49.50 NO BID NO BID
101
#6651-1/8
1/8 needle spikes per NO BID $8.00 20.00 NO BID 10.75 NO BID 11.48 NO BID NO BID
102|100
3/16 needle spikes per #6651-3/16
1031100 NO BID 500 NO BID NO BID 10.75 NO BID 11.70 NO BID NO BID
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104 BID ITEM Mo Jo Sports BQUEMETE  aeae e Bumblebee Riddle MEDCO Surgical Supply ~ BSN Sports Rogers Athletic Co  Pro.
105% needle spikes per 100 NO BID $8.00 20.00 NO BID 10.75 NO BID 10.72 NO BID NO BID
% pyramid spikes per 100
106 NO BID 8.00 20.00 NO BID 10.75 NO BID 10.72 NO BID NO BID
3/8 pyramid spikes per
107 100 NO BID 8.00 20.00 NO BID 10.75 NO BID 11.70 NO BID NO BID
Yellow Caution Tape
(specify length in NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.00
108 quote)
Red Caution Tape
(specify length in quote) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
109
110|5 Feet T-post NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Aluminum Relay Batons Bakers dz
NO BID 84.00 54.00 53.52 NO BID 15.60 NO BID 23.28
111|(Red-dozen) 29.00
. Bakers dz
Aluminum Relay Batons NO BID 84.00 54.00 53.52 NO BID 15.60 NO BID 23.28
112|(silver- dozen) 29.00
Aluminum Relay Batons B
(Black — dozen) NO BID 84.00 59.00 54.00 53.52 NO BID 15.60 NO BID 23.28
113 :




